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Carbon 

Sequestration Killed in

Committee
The Montana legislators killed

SB-66, a bill that was introduced
this session requiring carbon-se-
questration for Montana industry,
in committee.   SB66 was pushed
by Democrats as necessary so the
coal industry could develop in
Montana.   However, the Republi-
cans said it was not necessary un-
til the federal government issued
its rules. The measure would re-
quire of business and industry the
expensive process of underground
storage of carbon-dioxide which is
claimed to cause global warming.

••••••••
Kennametal 

Completes Tricon 

Acquisition,

Expands Mining 

Industry Business
Kennametal Inc. has completed

the previously announced acquisi-
tion of the assets of Tricon Metals
& Services, Inc. The business will
now be known as Kennametal Tri-
con Metals & Services and will be
part of Kennametal’s Advanced
Materials Solutions Group
(AMSG) business. 

Founded in 1968, Tricon Metals
& Services is among the nation’s
leading suppliers of proprietary
abrasion-resistant plate materials,
alloy shafting, and specialty steels
for the surface and underground
mining markets, including coal,
hard rock, and oil sands. A com-
plete service center, it provides
material processing, custom fabri-
cations, and technical services,
with corporate headquarters in
Birmingham, Alabama, and
branches in Chicago, Illinois, and
Elko, Nevada. Known as the gold
standard for consumable parts
and customer service, Tricon prod-
ucts include wear plates, wear
pins, shafting, and custom-fabri-
cated replacement components.
“Tricon’s application expertise and
quick response to customer needs
provide exceptional value in de-
manding environments,” com-
mented Gary Weismann, Ken-
nametal Vice President and Presi-
dent of Kennametal’s Advanced
Materials Solutions Group. “It also

provides us an opportunity to
leverage our presence in emerg-
ing markets, positioning us to fur-
ther achieve geographic balance.
Tricon’s leadership position in sur-
face mining, coupled with Ken-
nametal’s strength in underground
mining, provides a strong basis for
capitalizing on world-class tech-
nologies and capabilities to deliver
continued value, service and solu-
tions to our customers.” 

Founded in 1938 by metallurgist
Philip M. McKenna, Kennametal
Inc. is the undisputed global mar-
ket leader in tools for the mining
and road construction industries.
Represented in more than 60
countries, Kennametal’s world
headquarters are located in La-
trobe, Pennsylvania, with addition-
al facilities in Rogers, Arkansas,
F?rth, Germany, and Essen, Ger-
many. Kennametal designs and
builds cutter drums, toolholding
systems, and a complete line of
point-of-attack conical tools,
sleeves, and blocks in a wide
range of configurations. These in-
clude weld-on blocks and patented
quick-change systems requiring
no welding and, in certain applica-
tions, no bolts.

••••••••

Peabody Energy 

Announces Option to 

Acquire Coal Interests 

in Mongolia
Peabody Energy (NYSE: BTU)

recently announced that it has ob-
tained an option to purchase up to
a 50 percent interest in a joint ven-
ture holding Polo Resources Limit-
ed’s (AIM: PRL) coal and mineral
interests in Mongolia.

Polo’s Mongolian coal interests
have potential resources of over 1
billion tons, with a majority of its
coal licenses located in the South
Gobi coal region. This region hosts
some of the largest metallurgical
and thermal coal resources in
close proximity to China, with po-
tential to also access the Russian
and export markets. Polo also has
an active mining operation in Mon-
golia, with over 100 employees on-
site, primarily supplying the do-
mestic market.
Under the agreement, Peabody
would also be granted warrants to

enable the company to acquire an
approximate 15 percent equity in-
terest in Polo. The transaction is
targeted to close during the first
quarter of 2009, subject to the
completion of Peabody’s due dili-
gence review and other approvals.

“A joint venture with Polo’s ex-
isting platform will accelerate the
development of Peabody’s pres-
ence in one of the world’s premier
undeveloped coal regions,” said
Peabody Chairman and Chief Ex-
ecutive Officer Gregory H. Boyce.
“Because Polo has existing as-
sets, coal resources and person-
nel in Mongolia, this transaction
advances our goal of expanding
our presence in high-growth, high-
margin markets.”  

“Polo is excited about the op-
portunity to join forces with a com-
pany of the calibre of Peabody,”
said Stephen R. Dattels, Polo’s
Chief Executive Officer. “This al-
liance will provide the mining ex-
pertise and resources required to
develop our asset base and unlock
the currently unrecognized value
of Polo’s Mongolian interests.”
Peabody is the world’s largest pri-
vate-sector coal company. Its coal
products fuel approximately 10
percent of all U.S. electricity gen-
eration and 2 percent of worldwide
electricity.

Polo is an emerging energy
company focused on acquiring
and developing advanced stage
coal and uranium properties in
Asia and Australia.

••••••••

Victaulic Acquires 

Australian Rights to 

Victaulic Trademark
Victaulic Company announced re-
cently it has purchased the Aus-
tralian rights to the Victaulic trade-
mark from OneSteel. Terms of the
deal were not disclosed. 
“This strategic acquisition extends
our global ownership of the Vic-
taulic brand and strengthens our
ability to sell Victaulic piping prod-
ucts throughout Australia,” said
Victaulic CEO John Malloy. 

OneSteel is a fully integrat-
ed, global manufacturer and dis-
tributor of steel and finished steel
products, self-sufficient in both
iron ore and scrap metal. OneS-
teel is traded on the Australian

Stock Exchange (ASX: OST). 
Victaulic, a privately held company
headquartered in Easton, Pa.,
U.S.A., has manufacturing and
distribution facilities worldwide and
employs approximately 3,500 peo-
ple.  The company, and its sub-
sidiaries, develops products for a
full range of industrial, commercial
and institutional piping systems.

••••••••

Sioux Corporation 

Celebrates 70th 

Anniversary in 2009
Sioux Corporation, the lead-

ing manufacturer of application-
specific, industrial cleaning
equipment, water heaters and
steam generators, is celebrating
70 years in business during
2009. Sioux is one of the oldest
manufacturers in this industry,
and the brand is known for reli-
able products and superior cus-
tomer support.

The company was started in
1939 as Sioux Motor Cleaner
Manufacturing and was sold to
John and Virginia (Gini) Finger in
1965. The first units manufac-
tured by Sioux were used to
clean automotive engines and
farm equipment. As time went
on, Sioux changed its customer
focus to manufacturing plants,
oil and gas companies, concrete
plants and mining as well as oth-
er heavy duty applications.
Sioux continued to respond to
market needs, and additional
products were added to the line-
up, including steam generators,
cold and hot water pressure
washers, water heaters, solution
heaters, and all-electric hot wa-
ter pressure washers and steam
cleaners.

From an old store-front loca-
tion with seven employees, the
company now employs 49 em-
ployees and exports to 70 coun-
tries around the world. Sioux has
several major product lines as
well as the ability to engineer
custom equipment to customer
specifications. Sioux has also
built a strong network of distribu-
tors and maintains a strong work
force and work ethic.
“We are grateful to celebrate
such a monumental milestone
and we thank our customers and

employees for their continued
business and loyalty,” stated
President/CEO John W. Finger.
“We approach every year with
the same goal – to provide ex-
ceptional customer service, and
to improve our products for the
markets we serve. This year, we
will enjoy it that much more be-
cause of the significance.”
Sioux Corporation is the leading
designer and manufacturer of
application-specific, industrial
cleaning equipment, specialty
water heaters, steam generators
and related custom equipment
for markets such as petroleum
exploration and production, con-
crete production, mining, manu-
facturing, greenhouse, marine,
government, food and beverage,
and utilities. Visit the Sioux Cor-
poration website at
www.sioux.com.

•••••••• 

Congresswoman Joins

Select Committee at 

Critical Time for 

Energy Debate
Rep. Shelley Moore Capito (R-

WV) has been outspoken about
the need for comprehensive en-
ergy solutions and she will now
have a new platform for address-
ing those issues as a member of
the House of Representatives'
Select Committee on Energy In-
dependence and Global Warm-
ing. 

Capito will bring a coal-state
perspective to the committee's
work on energy and climate
change.

"Our energy future should be
at the forefront of the national
discussion, and I'm excited to
bring a West Virginia voice to
those issues as a member of this
committee," said Capito. "From
clean coal, to wind energy and
other alternative technology, our
state has an important role to
play."

"The President has pledged to
make energy a top priority and
this committee stands to be inte-
gral in those conversations. I'm
honored to be named to this new
post and I'm looking forward to
working with my new col-
leagues."            cl
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Damascus ad

“Coal: America's Path to

Energy Security” will be the

theme for the Eastern Coal

Council’s 30th annual confer-

ence and exposition, May 11

and 12, 2009, at the

Meadowview Conference

Center, Kingsport, TN. The

Eastern Coal Council was

founded in 1979 as a member-

ship organization representing

industries, businesses, educa-

tional institutions, educators

and researchers, and elected

officials who work together to

promote coal and to educate

people about the importance of

coal as it relates to energy pro-

duction and national energy

security. The Council has

played a leading role in promot-

ing coal as the appropriate

energy source for America’s

future. Coal is an abundant and

natural resource in America.

There is enough coal to meet

this nation’s energy needs now

and into the future.

The theme for this year’s

meeting, “Coal: America's

Path to Energy Security,” will

highlight America’s need to

expand energy independence

through clean coal technolo-

gies, coal to liquids, carbon

capture and storage, the elec-

tric grid, and critical opportuni-

ties and issues facing energy

industries.   Coal and electric

power are essential to modern

society.  The fact remains that

this nation’s economic prosper-

ity cannot be achieved without

electricity, and enough electrici-

ty cannot be generated to meet

demand without coal. 

Rick Boucher (VA), U. S.

House of Representatives and

Kevin Crutchfield, President,

Alpha Natural Resources will

headline the meeting. 

The U. S. Department of

Energy has put together a ses-

sion on Carbon, Capture and

Storage highlighting industry

researchers.

Limited exhibit space is

available.  The cost for exhibit

space is only $500.00.  One

person attends all meeting

functions and special activities

planned for attendees.  

The annual golf outing will be

Monday afternoon, May 11th at

the Meadowview’s Cattails,

which is nestled between the

rolling foothills of the

Appalachian and Great Smoky

Mountain, offering fantastic

scenery as you play the chal-

lenging par  71 golf course.

The 18 Hole championship

course was designed by the

renowned Denis Griffiths and is

conveniently located adjacent

to the Hotel.  

For additional information

or to register contact the

Eastern Coal Council at 

276-964-6363 or 964-9088, or

visit Eastern Coal Council’s

website for additional informa-

tion and updates 

“ www.easterncoalcouncil.org “ 

cl

Eastern Coal Council Celebrates 
30th Annual Conference

Meadowview Conference Center
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WE MINE THE COAL THAT POWERS THE NATION.

Work with us and you’ll help provide the coal that generates over half the nation’s electricity.
Come visit us at www.consolcareers.com. An equal opportunity employer.
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